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Re: Re: CANCELLATION OF INSURANCE - PREMIUM INSTALLME
NT [ 3 PREMIUMS PAID ] Call ID # 186011095 Call ID # 1862767
56

ICICI Prudential Life Insurance Co. Ltd <lifeline@iciciprulife.com>
To: sourav.stex@yahoo.com

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to your email dated 19/11/2020 for your ICICI Prudential policy number 21600168.
We value your relationship with us. Thank you for giving us the opportunity to serve you.
We hereby inform you that as per our records your policy has acquired IS (Interim surrender) status and as per the policy terms
and conditions after completion of the lock-in period 20/11/2022 your policy will be foreclosed and you will be entitled to
receive PD (Policy discontinuance) foreclosed payout. 
  
However, if you wish to get the foreclosed payout credited directly in your bank account after completion of the lockin period
kindly revert to us with the scan copy of the below-mentioned documents. 
  
1) Id Proof 
2) Cancelled Cheque copy
Note: Cancelled Cheque copy should have printed account number and name of the customer and Crosslines should not be
marked over account number. 

Please note: In the event of updation of an NRE account, the payouts would be generated into your bank account post
submission of the bank statements which reflects the source of premiums paid are from the NRE account which would enable
us for repatriation of the funds and also request you to attach/send the above mentioned documents password unprotected.
Hope we have been able to address back to your concern.
We have some exclusive offer for you!! To know more please Click here  

We care for you. For your safety, we offer ways in which you can manage your policy from home. To get instant answers to
your policy queries, simply visit www.iciciprulife.com  to chat with LiGO anytime, anywhere. 

Any death or hospitalization claim raised in relation to Covid- 19, will be covered* across all our products subject to policy
terms and conditions.  

Yours Sincerely, 
Kanchan Gupta 
Customer Service Team 
ICICI Prudential Life Insurance Co. Ltd. 
----------------------------------------------------------

Policy Number : 21600168 , Elite Life Super,UIN:105L156V01 , To help us answer your queries: Click here 

Customer Care helpline No.:1860-266-7766,Timings: 10.00 A.M. to 7.00 P.M Monday to Saturday (except National holidays) 
NRI helpline No: +912261930777, Timings: 24x7 (except National holidays) 
© 2017, Reg No: 105, ICICI Prudential Life Insurance Co. Ltd. Reg Address: 1089 Appasaheb Marathe Marg, Prabhadevi,
Mumbai- 400025.CIN:L66010MH2000PLC127837 

Comp/doc/Oct/2016/613 

---------------Original Message------------------ 
Subject: Re: CANCELLATION OF INSURANCE - PREMIUM INSTALLMENT [ 3 PREMIUMS PAID ] Call ID # 186011095 Date Sent:
19-November-2020 Time Sent: 19:41:23 PM Sender ID: sourav.stex@yahoo.com Message Text: External Email Warning: Do not
click on any attachment or links/URL in this email unless sender is reliable. 

Hi Vivek - IF you dont mind can you let me know - the details about the lock-in period for this policy - 21600168. 
and when the payout is scheduled ?? 

regards 
sourav 
On Thursday, 19 November, 2020, 06:40:44 pm IST, ICICI Prudential Life Insurance Co. Ltd wrote:  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

We refer to your email dated 15/11/2020 for your ICICI Prudential policy number 21600168. 

We value your relationship with us. Thank you for giving us the opportunity to serve you. 

We hereby inform you that your request has been processed and the above mentioned policy has been Interim surrender. 

Further, the payout will be credited to you after the lock in period. 

Hope we have been able to address back to your concern. 

  

Yours Sincerely, 

Vivek Dubey 
Customer Service Team 
ICICI Prudential Life Insurance Co. Ltd. 
----------------------------------------------------------  
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Policy Number : 21600168 , Elite Life Super,UIN:105L156V01 , To help us answer your queries: Click here 

Customer Care helpline No.:1860-266-7766,Timings: 10.00 A.M. to 7.00 P.M Monday to Saturday (except National holidays) 
NRI helpline No: +912261930777, Timings: 24x7 (except National holidays) 
© 2017, Reg No: 105, ICICI Prudential Life Insurance Co. Ltd. Reg Address: 1089 Appasaheb Marathe Marg, Prabhadevi,
Mumbai- 400025.CIN:L66010MH2000PLC127837 
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---------------Original Message------------------ 
External Email Warning: Do not click on any attachment or links/URL in this email unless sender is reliable. 

DEAR ICICI PRUDENTIAL TEAM -  

CASE STUDY : ICICI PRUDENTIAL INSURANCE : ELITE LIFE SUPER - INSURANCE PREMIUM Cancellation 
INSURANCE POLICY NUMBER : 21600168 
TOTAL NUMBER OF PREMIUM INSTALLMENTS PAID : 200000 X [ 3 PREMIUM INSTALLMENTS ] = 600000 [ 6 LAKHS ]. 

I WISH TO DISCONTINUE : PAYMENT OF FUTURE PREMIUM INSTALLMENTS THAT IS DUE ON : 20 TH. 

I HAVE TAKEN THIS FINAL DECISION. 
THANK YOU VERY MUCH FOR THE COOPERATION ! 

PLEASE STOP INSURANCE PREMIUM DEDUCTION FROM MY ACCOUNT IMMEDIATELY. 

SOURAV DAS 
NO 1485 BBSR 
PHONE: 9586242067 
MAIL: SOURAV.STEX@YAHOO.COM Attachments: CC Receipients:
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